ORIGINAL ORDINANCE NO.: 2033 INTRODUCED BY: O’ DOHERTY
ENROLLED ORDINANCE NO.: 1797

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING LMC CHAPTER 15.24 ADOPTING THE 2021 INTERNATIONAL
CODE SERIES AND UPDATING LANGUAGE TO CONFORM TO INTERNATIONAL CODE SERIES

WHEREAS, the newest revisions to International Code Series are periodically adopted by the State of
Wyoming and are then adopted by the municipality; and

WHEREAS, updating language to conform to International Code Series.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LARAMIE:

Section 1: That LMC 15.24 be amended to read as follows in the included sections:
Chapter 15.24 - BUILDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION
15.24.000 - General provisions.

A. The purpose of this chapter is to protect the health and safety of the public by
regulating the construction, alteration, repair, demolition, and moving of
buildings and structures within the city. The 2018 most recently issued editions
of the International Residential Code for One-and Two-Family Dwellings,
International Building Code, International Existing Building Code, International
Mechanical Code, International Plumbing Code, International Fuel Gas Code,
and the International Energy Conservation Code, all are adopted as published by
the International Code Council; the 204+7most recently issued edition of the
National Electrical Code, published by the National Fire Protection Association,
are hereby adopted with certain amendments, additions and deletions thereto
found to be in the best interest of the residents of the city. (Ord. 1466 § 2(att. A),
2005; Ord. 1538 § 1, 2008;Ord. 1754, 11-7-2018).

B. Building official.

1. Generally. There is created the office of the building official. The city manager
shall designate a representative to act as the building official. (Ord. 1223 § 1, 1998:
Ord. 928 § 1, 1988: prior code § 9-1).

2. Recordation. The building official shall keep complete records of all permits
issued and inspections made and other official work performed under the
provisions of this title. (Ord. 928 § 5, 1988: prior code § 9-2(d)).

3. Fees.

a. Determination of Fees. The city council shall determine, adopt and amend
feesrequired under this chapter
pursuant to subsection 15.06.030.B. of this code.

b. Fees to be Paid. No permit, license, application, or other fees shall be
processed until the established fee has been paid.

c. Refund of Fees. Permit, license, application, certificate, and all
other fees required by this code are nonrefundable. The following
exceptions may only be refunded within one hundred eighty days of
the fee paymmenteroverpayment:

(i) The city manager's office or other applicable reviewing body
determines that an application was accepted in error.



(i) The fee paid exceeds the amount due. Overpayment will be refunded to the
applicant.
(i) No more than eighty percent of any permit fee may be
refunded when no work has been issued in accordance with
thiscode.
(v) No more than eighty percent of any plan review fee may be
refunded when an application is withdrawn or canceled before any
plan review effort has been expended.

C. Violation, penalty, -and-enforcement, and appeals.

1. Purpose. The city council finds that the enforcement of the municipal code and
applicable building and fire codes
throughout the city is vital to the public's health, safety and quality of life, and
depends upon effective judicial and/or administrative enforcement.

2. General Penalty. Any person or entity violating the provisions of this
chapter may be prosecuted and punished pursuant to chapter 1.28 of this
code and/or pursuant to a citation issued under this chapter, and may also
be subject to judicial action to compel compliance with this chapter.

3. Citation Authority.

a. Pursuant to Wyoming statutes, council hereby appoints special municipal
officers, to be specifically designated
by the city manager by name or position, to issue citations into
municipal court for the purpose of enforcing violations of this chapter
ofthe Municipal Code. These special municipal officers are not peace
officersand are subject to the rights and restrictions set out in Wyoming
Statutes.

b. Persons or entities violating provisions of this chapter are subject to, along
with any other applicable penalties or re
citations into municipal court bearing the following fines, exclusive of court
costs and other fees:

Code Citation Event Fine

15.24.000.D Work without a permit (15t $50.00
offense)

15.24.000.D Work without a permit (21d $250.00
offense within 5 years of first
offense)

15.24.000.D Work without a permit (31d $750.00
offense and all other repeat
offenses within 5 years of first
offense)

15.24.000.E Work without a license 15t $250.00
Offense)

15.24.000.E Work withoutalicense (2nd $500.00

Offense within 5 years of first
offense)




15.24.000.E

Work without a license 3'd and all | $750.00
other repeat offenses within 5 years
of first offense)

15.24.040

International Fire Code violation $500.00

15.24

$250.00
Other violations of this chapter

(Ord. No. 1757, § 2, 12-4-2018)

D. Permits required.

1.

No person or entity may commence any work, or allow any work to begin on
premises owned or controlled by that

person or entity, before obtaining all permits required under this chapter.
Permits are a privilege, good for the period issued, and may be revoked or
suspended for cause.

No person or entity or entity whose agents are guilty of three violations of
working without a permit in any twelve- month period shall be eligible for
another permit for six months following the last violation, and existing
permits shall be deemed revoked. A person or entity may appeal that permit
denial to the Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals, whose decision is

final, and which may authorize the issuance of a permit with conditions.(Ord.
No. 1757, § 2, 12-4-2018)

E. Licenses Required.

1.

No person or entity may commence any work, or allow any work to begin
on premises owned or controlled by that person or entity, before obtaining
all licenses required under this chapter. Licenses are a privilege, good for the
period issued, and may be revoked or suspended for cause.

No person or entity or entity whose agents are guilty of three violations of
working without a license in any twelve-month period shall be eligible for
another license for six months following the last violation, and existing
licenses shall be deemed revoked. A person or entity may appeal that
license denial to the building and fire code board of appeals, whose decision

is final, and which may authorize the issuance of a permit with conditions.
(Ord. 1757, § 3, 12-4-2018)

Violations, Stop Work Orders, and Appeals

All violations, stop work orders, and appeals are addressed in accordance with the

most recently issued editions of the International Code Series.

G. Liability

The city assumes no duty of care by virtue of the adoption or amendment of this code. No
person is justified in relying upon the approval of a plan . the results of an inspection, or the
issuance of certificate of inspection or occupancy, and such approvals, inspections, and
certificates are not a guarantee that the plan or work so approved, inspected or certified in
fact complies with all the requirements of this code. It is the duty of the person owning,
controlling, or constructing any building or structure to insure that the work is done in
accordance with this code, and it is such persons and not the city who are to insure that the
work is done in accordance with this code, and it is such persons and not the city who are




responsible for damages caused by negligent breach of such duty. (Ord 1466: 24, 2005)

(Ord. 1466 § 2(att. A), 2005; Ord. 1538 § 1, 2008; Ord. No. 1578, § 2(att. A), 3-2-2010; Ord. No.
1658, § 1, 5-6-2014; Ord. No. 1728 , § 16, 4-18-2017; Ord. No. 1734, §§ 1, 2, 6-20-2017; Ord.
No. 1757, §§ 1-—3, 12-4-2018)

15.24.010 - Building codes.

The most recently issued editions of International Code Council Series and are hereby adopted as
published. The most recently issued edition of the National Electrical code, published by the
National Fire Protection Association are hereby adopted as published. Copies of such codes are on
file in the office of the building official.

A. International Residential Code
A The 2048-most recently issued editions of the International Residential Code for
One- and Two-Family Dwellings, including Appendix Chapters AE, AG, AH, AK,
AM, AQ, AR and AS are adopted by reference and have the same force and effect
as though fully set forth in this chapter, except as specifically amended by this
chapter. Copies of such codes are on file in the office of the building official. (Ord.
1754, 11-7-2018)
1. Section R101.1 amended—Title.
The first paragraph of Section R101.1 is amended to read as follows: These
provisions shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and Two-Family
Dwellings of the city of Laramie, and shall be cited as such and will be
referred herein as "this code." (Ord. 1466 § 4, 2005).

2. Sections R102 through R114 amended—Administration.
e R ol T 10K e F i . oty Thi o shalll

3. TableR301.2(1) amended—Climatic and geographic design criteria.
Table R301.2(1), "Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria," is amended to read
as follows:

Amended Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria Table

Ground snow load = | 30 psf (1.44 kN/m2)
Roof snow load = | 30 psf

Wind speed = | 115 mph (3-second gust)
Topographic effects = | Exposure C

Special wind region = | No

Wind-borne debris zone = | No

Seismic design category = | Site Class B




Weathering

Severe

Frost line depth

42" (1067 mm)

Termite

none to slight

Decay

none to slight

Winter design temperature

-10 degrees F (-23 degrees C)

Ice shield underlayment required

Yes

Flood hazards

(Chapter 15.20 of the Laramie municipal code)
FIRM Community Panel #560002 0005 D, October
16. 1996

Air freezing index

1500

Mean annual temperature

40 degrees F (4.4 degrees C)

Flood hazards

Chapter 15.20 of the Laramie Municipal Code—The
Flood Insurance Study for Albany County and
Incorporated Areas, dated June 16,2011, or as revised
effective May 17,2017.

(Ord. 1466 § 6, 2005; Ord. 1754 ,

11-7-2018)




B. International Building Code.

1.

The 26048-most recently issued editions of the International Building Code,
including Appendix Chapters C, E, H, I, and J, are adopted by reference and have
the same force and effect as though fully set forth in this chapter, except as
specifically amended by this chapter. Copies of such codes are on file in the
office of the building official. (Ord. 1754-, 11-7-2018)

Section 101.1 amended—Title.

The first paragraph of Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows: These




regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the city of Laramie,
hereinafter referred to as "this code." (Ord. 1466 § 20, 2005).

3. Reserved.

4. Reserved.

7.6.Section 105.5 amended—Expiration.
Add a new paragraph to the end of Section 105.5 to read as follows: Every
permit issued by the building official under the provisions of this code shall
expire by limitation and become null and void if the building or work
authorized by such permit is not completed and approved for occupancy
within three years from the date the permit was issued, or three years from
the effective date of the ordinance codified under this section, whichever is
later. In order to renew or extend a permit, the applicant shall submit a new
permit application with all required submittal documents showing compliance
with the codes in effect at the time the new application is received. New
permit and plan review fees may be prorated based on the amount of work
completed under a previous expired permit. (Ord. 1466 § 25, 2005).

8.7.Reserved.

9.8.Section 109.2 amended—Schedule of permit fees.
The fee for each permit shall be as set forth pursuant to Section 15.06.030.B
ofthe Laramie Municipal Code. Forthe purpose of determining fees the total
building valuation may be reduced by the building official in an amount
equal to the valuation included under other permits issued for other
elements or structure in the building or structure.




44.9.Section 114.1 amended—Unlawful acts.
Violations of this code are punishable as provided by Chapters 1.28 AND 15.26

of the Laramie Municipal Code.

12.10. Section 1608.1 amended—Snow loads—General.
Section 1608.1 is amended to read as follows: The minimum roof snow load
shall be thirty pounds per square foot (1.44 kIN/m2), but the design roof load
shall not be less than that determined by Section 1607. (Ord. 1466 § 31, 2005).

43.11. Section 1608.2 amended—Ground snow loads.
Section 1608.2 is amended to read as follows: The minimum ground snow

loads to be used in determining the design snow loads for roofs shall be 30 psf
(1.44 kN/m2). (Ord. 1466 § 32, 2005).

1412, Reserved.

16.13. The second sentence of 1612.3 is amended to read as follows: The flood

hazard map shall include, at a minimum, areas of special flood hazard as
identified by the Federal Emergency Management Agency in an engineering
report entitled "The Flood Insurance Study for Albany County and
Incorporated Areas," dated June 16, 2011, as amended or revised with the
accompanying Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) and Flood Boundary and
Floodway Map (FBFM) and related supporting data with any revisions thereto,
OR AS REVISED EFFECTIVE MAY 17, 2017.

4714, Section 1809.5 amended—Frost protection.
Add new sentence to the end of Method 1 to read as follows: The minimum
frost depth shall be not less than 42" (1067 mm) below finished grade.

18.15. Reserved.
49.16. Reserved.
20.17. Section J103.2 amended—Permits required—Exemptions.

Add exemption 8 to Section J103.2 to read as follows: A grading permit is
not required for subdivision development where an approved plan or
subdivision agreement is in place, or where written approval has otherwise
been obtained for work located entirely within a public right-of-way when
approved by the city engineer. (Ord. 1466 § 41, 2005).



. International Existing Building Code.

1. The 2648 most recently issued editions of the International Existing Building Code
is adopted by reference and has the same force and effect as though
fully set forth in this chapter, except as specifically amended by this chapter.
Copies of such codes are on file in the office of the building official. (Ord.
1754 ,11-7-2018)
2. Section 101.1 amended—Title.
Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows: These regulations shall be
known as the Existing Building Code of the city of Laramie, hereinafter
referred to as "this code." (Ord. 1466 § 43, 2005).

3. Reserved.

4. Sections 103 through 115 amended—Administration.

S 103 theonah 115.icdeleted i i This code-shalll

. Uniform Code forthe Abatement of Dangerous Buildings.

1. Adoption.
The 1997 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings,
published by the International Conference of Building Officials, is adopted
by reference and have the same force and effect as though fully set forth in
this chapter, except as specifically amended in Sections 15.04.610 through
15.04.680. Copies of such codes are on file in the City Manager's Office. (Ord.
1466 §47,2005;Ord. 1754, 11-7-2018).

2. Section 201.3 amended—Right-of-entry.
Add new sentence to the end of the first paragraph of Section 201.3 to read as
follows: In cases of emergency where there is believed to be imminent danger
to any person the building official may enter any property to make any
necessary inspections under this code or to take any other action authorized
by this code without permission or warrant. (Ord. 1466 § 48,2005).

3. Section 203 amended—Violations.
Add new sentence to the end of Section 203 to read as follows: No owner or
person having charge or control over any building or premises shall fail to
comply with any order issued to such person under this code. (Ord. 1466 §
49, 2005).

4. Section 302 amended—Dangerous building.

The first sentence of Section 302 is amended to read as follows: For the
purposes of this code, any building or structure which has any or all of the
conditions or defects hereinafter described shall be considered to be a
dangerous building. (Ord. 1466 § 50, 2005).



Section 401.2 (4) amended—Notice and order.

Subsection 4 of Section 401.2 is amended to read as follows: Statements
advising that if any required repair or demolition work (without vacation
also being required) is not commenced within the time specified, the
building official (i) will order the building vacated and posted to prevent
further occupancy until the work is completed, (ii) may proceed to cause the
work to be done and charge the costs thereof against the property or its
owner, and (iii) may cause a summons and complaint to be served upon the
property owner or any person having charge or control over the building or
premises for failure to make the required repairs or demolition within the
specified time. (Ord. 1466 §51,2005).

Section 801.1 amended—Performance of work of repair or demolition—
Procedure.

Section 801.1 is amended to read as follows: When any work of repair or
demolition is to be done pursuant to Section 701.3, Item 3, of this code, the
building official shall arrange to have the work performed by personnel of
this jurisdiction or by private contract under direction of the building official.
Plans and specifications therefore may be prepared by the building official, or
the building official may employ such architectural or engineering assistance
on a contractual basis as deemed necessary. If any of the work is to be
accomplished by private contract, standard public works contractual
procedures shall be followed, unless such work is deemed to be an emergency.
(Ord. 1466 § 52, 2005).

Section 801.2 amended—Costs.

Section 801.2 is amended to read as follows: A statement of the cost of
such work, plus fifteen percent for administrative overhead, shall be billed
to the record owner of the property. If not paid within thirty days of the
billing it shall be transmitted to the city council who, upon approval, shall
cause the same to be paid as a special assessment against the property. Costs
incurred shall be paid out of the city treasury. Such costs shall be charged to
the owner of the property or premises involved as a special assessment on
the land on which the building or structureislocated,andshall be collected
inthemannerprescribed forspecial assessments. (Ord. 1466 § 53,2005).

Section 802 amended Repair and demolition fund.
Section 802 is deleted in its entirety. (Ord. 1466 § 54, 2005).

. Chapter 9 amended—Recovery of cost of repair or demolition.

Chapter 9 is deleted in its entirety. (Ord. 1466 § 55, 2005).

E. International Energy Conservation Code.

1.

The 2648 most recently issued editions of the International Energy
Conservation Code, is adopted by reference and has the same force and effect
as though fully set forth in this chapter, except as specifically amended by this
chapter. Copies of such codes are on file in the office of the building official.
(Ord. 1754, 11-7-2018).

Section 101.1 amended—Title.

Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows: The regulations shall be known as
the Energy Conservation Code of the city of Laramie, and shall be cited as
such. It is referred to herein as "this code." (Ord. 1466 § 57, 2005).




entiretsy:

F. Moving Buildings.

1. Building Defined. For the purposes of this division, the term "building" means
any permanent structure for the shelter or enclosure of persons, animals or

property.

2. Permit,
a. Required. No person shall move any building over, along or across any street
or alley in the city without obtaining a permit from the building official.
Exceptions:

1.

3.

Mobile, manufactured or modular buildings designed to be moved on
streets and highways, provided they utilize the original manufacturer's
chassis or off-frame equipment. Movements are subject to Chapter 12.18
ofthe Laramie municipal code as it applies to vehicle size and weight
limits,

Garden sheds and accessory buildings being transported between a
manufacturing facility orretail sales location to a point of customer sale.
Movements may be subject to Chapter 12.18 ofthe Laramie municipal
code asitapplies to vehicle size and weight limits.

Buildings that do not exceed eight feet six inches in width, and do not have
atransportable height exceeding fourteen feet.

Exemptions from permit requirements shall not be deemed to grant authorization
for any movements to be done in an unsafe manner or in violation of any other laws,
rules, codes or ordinances.
b. Application.
(i) Filing. A person seeking issuance of a permit under this division shall file

an application for such permit with the building official.

Form. The application shall be made in writing, upon forms provided by

the building official and shall be filed with the building official.

Contents. The application shall set forth:

(1) A description of the building proposed to be moved, giving the street

number, construction materials,

dimensions, number of rooms and condition of exterior and interior;

A legal description of the lot from which the building is to be moved;

A legal description of the lot to which the building is to be moved,;

The streets and alleys over, along or across which the building is

proposed to be moved;

Proposed moving date, length of time and anticipated hours of moving;

(6) The approval of the fire chief, chief of police, the Wyoming
Department of Transportation, thelocal franchised utility companies
when required by the building official;

(1) Any additional information which the building official finds
necessary for a determination of whether a permit should be issued.

Accompanying Papers. The application shall be supplemented by

sufficient evidence acceptable to the building official that all taxes and city

charges against the building to be moved are paid in full and a signed
statement by the owner of the building that the mover is entitled to move
same. The application shall be accompanied by:

(1) A nonrefundable permit fee in the amount of one hundred dollars;

(2) A certificate of insurance acceptable to the city attorney as to company,
form and content, indicating a commercial auto liability policy with
one million dollars combined single-limit bodily injury and property
damage;

— o —
W N
e

—
(4;]
~



(3) A corporate surety bond, with a company and in form and content
acceptable to the city attorney in the amount of ten thousand dollars,
running to the city as an indemnity to insure compliance with the
requirements in [subsection] 15.24.010.F 4.

¢. Inspection—Grounds for Refusal. The building official shall inspect the
building and the applicant's equipment to determine whether the standards for
issuance of a permit are met. He shall refuse to issue a permit if he finds:

() That any application requirement or any fee or deposit requirement has
not been complied with;

(i) That the building is too large to move without endangering persons or
property in the city;

(i) That the building is in such a state of deterioration or disrepair or is
otherwise so structurally unsafe that it could not be moved without
endangering persons and property in the city;

(v) That the applicant's equipment is unsafe and that persons and property
would be endangered by its use;

(v That zoning or other ordinances would be violated by the building in its
new location;

(vi) That for any other reason, persons or property in the city would be
endangered by the moving of the building,

d. Issuance. Upon determination that all standards forissuance of the permit are
met, the building official shall issue the permit and deposit the surety bond
and evidence of auto liability insurance in force with the city treasurer.

3. Assurance of public safety. The building official and the chief of police shall act
to assure maximum safety to persons

and property in the city and to minimize congestion in traffic hazards on public

streets.

4. Permittee's Duties. Every permittee under this section shall:

a. Move a building over only the streets or alleys designated for such use in the
written permit;

b. Notify the building official in writing of a desired change in moving date and
hours as proposed in the application;

¢. Notify the building official in writing of any and all damage done to
property belonging to the city or other persons or their property within
twenty-four hours after the damage or injury has occurred;

d. Provide flagmen, warning lights or flares as required by the chief of police to
warn the public of the obstruction and to protect the public from damage or
injury by reason of the removal of the building;

e. Comply with the fire and building codes, the zoning ordinances and all other
applicable ordinances and laws upon relocating the building in the city;

f. Remove all rubbish and materials, fill all excavations as required by section
8.64 of the Laramie municipal code, and provide erosion prevention measures
as described by subsection 15.14.020.E., of the unified development code.
Excavations may be fenced or barricaded, and materials may be stored on
such site, as directed by the building official where a valid building permit
has been issued for new construction;

g. Ensure that the sewer and water service lines are abandoned, as required by
the utility. Permittee shall notify the telephone, television, gas and electric
service companies to remove their services;

h. Not permit the building being removed to remain on any street or alley of the
city between the hours of sunset and sunrise unless authorized in writing by
the building official.

5. Permittee's Liability. The permittee shall be liable for damage to any street, alley,
or improvement, including damage to trees, landscaping, signs, utility poles and
lines, traffic signals and other public or private improvements.



(Ord. 1466 §§ 3, 14, 15, 17, 21, 23, 26, 28, 34, 36, 38—40, 46, 56, 2005; Ord. 1483 § 19, 2006;
Ord. 1499 § 6, 2006; Ord. 1538 §§ 2(att.A), 4—7, 1216, 2008; Ord. No. 1578, § 2(att. A), 3-2-
2010; Ord. No. 1596, § 61, 5-3-2011; Ord. No. 1658 , §§ 2—24, 5-6-2014; Ord.

No. 1734, §§ 3—12, 6-20-2017; Ord. 1754 , 11-7-2018)

15.24.020 -Plumbing, heating and cooling codes.

D. International Plumbing Code.

1.

The 2648 most recently issued editions of the International Plumbing Code,
including Appendix Chapters C and E are adopted by reference and have the same
force and effect as though fully set forth in this chapter, except as specifically
amended by this chapter. Copies of such codes are on file in the office of the
building official. (Ord. 1754, 11-7-2018)

Section 101.1 amended—Title.
Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows: These regulations shall be known as

the International Plumbing Code of th Laramie hereinafter referred to as "this
code." (Ord. 1466 § 62, 2005).

Section +06-6-2109.2 amended—Fee schedule.

Section +66-6-2109.2 is amended to read as follows: The fees for all
plumbing work shall be pursuant to section 15.06.030.B of this Code and
may be found in the Administrative Manual.

Section +06-6-3109.5 amended—Fee refunds.
Section +06-6-3109.5 is amended to read as follows: The Department or
applicable reviewing body shall refund fees pursuantto 15.24.000.B.3.




E. International Fuel Gas Code.

1.

Adoption. The 2648 most recently issued editions of the International Fuel Gas
Code is adopted by reference and has the same force and effect as though fully
set forth in this chapter, except as specifically amended by this Chapter.
Copies of such codes are on file in the building official. (Ord. 1466 § 72,2005;
Ord. 1538 § 22,2008; Ord. 1754, 11-7-2018).

Section 101.1 amended—Title.
Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows: These regulations shall be known as

the Fuel Gas Code of the city of Laramie hereinafter referred to as "this code."”
(Ord. 1466 § 73, 2005).

Sections 103 through 104—Administration.

Sections 103 through 104 of the International Fuel Gas Code are deleted in their
entirety. The intention is that this code be administered in accordance with the
administrative provisions of the International Building Code, as adopted and
amended by this chapter. (Ord. 1466 § 74, 2005; Ord. 1538 § 23, 2008).

5.4.Section +66-6-3109 amended—Fee refunds.

Section +66-6-3109 of the International Fuel Gas Code is amended to read as

follows. The Department or applicable reviewing body shall refund fees
pursuant to 15.24.000.8.3.

6—Section 08 damended—Violationpenalties:

. . . . . . .. s . e




10.5.Reserved.

4-6.Section 621.4 amended—Prohibited locations.

Seetion303-3-(Ord. 1466 § 84, 2005).

F. International Mechanical Code.

1.

The 260+8 most recently issued editions of the International Mechanical Code is
adopted by reference and has the same force and effect as though fully

set forth in this chapter, except as specifically amended by this chapter. Copies
of such codes are on file in the office of the building official. (Ord. 1754-, 11-
7-2018)

Section 101.1 amended—Title.
Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows: These regulations shall be known as

the Mechanical Code of the city of Laramie hereinafter referred to as "this code."
(Ord. 1466 § 86, 2005).

Sections 103 and 104 amended—Administration.

Sections 103 and 104 of the International Mechanical Code are deleted in
their entirety. It is intended that the code be administered in accordance with
the International Building Code, as adopted and amended by this chapter. (Ord.
1466 § 87,2005; Ord. No. 1538 § 28, 2008).

Section +86-5-2109.2 amended—Fee schedule.

Section +86-5-2109.2 is amended to read as follows: The fees for all mechanical
work shall be pursuant to section 15.06.030.B of this code and may be found in
the Administrative Manual.




5. Section +06-5-3109.2 amended—Fee refunds.
a. Section 106.5.3 is amended to read as follows: The Department or applicable
reviewing body shall refund fees pursuant to 15.24.000.B.3.

12.6.Reserved.

(Ord. 1466 §§ 15, 75, 81, 85, 2005; Ord. 1538 §§ 19, 24, 27, 29, 2008; Ord. No. 1578, § 2(att. A)
3-2-2010; Ord. No. 1658 , §§ 25—30,5-6-2014; Ord. No. 1728 , § 16, 4-18-2017; Ord. No. 1734 ,
§§ 13—15, 6-20-2017; Ord. 1754, 11-7-2018)

L}

15.24.030- Electrical codes.

A. National Electrical Code.



1. The 2647 most recently issued editions of the National Electrical Code is adopted
by reference and has the same force and effect as though fully set forth in this
chapter, except as specifically amended by this chapter. Copies of such codes are
on file in the office of the
building official.

15.24.040- Fire code.

A. International Fire Code.

1.

Adoption of the 26048 most recently issued editions of the International Fire
Code, including Appendix B, D, E, F and G, is adopted by reference and has
the same force and effect as though fully set forth in this chapter, except as
specifically amended by this chapter. Copies of such codes are on file in the
community development department (Ord. 1466 § 102,2005, Ord. 1538 §
332,2008;0Ord. 1754,11-7-2018).

Section 101.1 amended—Title.
Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows: These regulations shall be

known as the Fire Code of the city of Laramie hereinafter referred to as
"this code." (Ord. 1466 § 103, 2005).

3—Section102-7-amended—Reference-codes-and-standards:
Secti 02 7 of the International Eire Code od i

4.3.Section 105.1.1 amended—Permits required.

Section 105.1.1 is amended to read as follows: A permit shall be obtained
from the department of fire prevention prior to engaging in the following
activities, operations, practices or functions: activities, operations, practices
or functions which did not require a permit prior to the adoption of this code
may continue until the person engaging in the activities, operations, practices
or functions is notified by the Fire Department that a permit is required.
Within 30 days of notice or less (if specified in the notice) the person shall
obtain a permit or cease to engage in the activities, operations, practices or
functions. (Ord. 1466 § 106, 2005).

5.4.Section +08-6109.6 amended—Overcrowding.

Overcrowding or admittance of any person beyond the approved capacity of a
building or a portion thereof shall not be allowed. The fire code official or
designee, upon finding any overcrowding conditions or obstructions in aisles,
passageways or other means of egress, or upon finding any condition which
constitutes a life safety hazard shall be authorized to cause the event to be



stopped until such condition or obstruction is corrected and/or a sworn police
officer may issue a written citation of violation. (Ord. 1507 § 2,2007; Ord.
1754 ,11-7-2018).

8.5.Section H0-3112.3 amended—Notice of violation.
When the fire code official finds a building, premises, vehicle, storage facility
or outdoor area that is in violation of this code, the fire code official or
designee is authorized to prepare a written notice of violation describing the
conditions deemed unsafe and, when compliance is not immediate, specifying
a time for re-inspection. If the violation I an immediate life safety hazard,
including but not limited to overcrowding or an obstructed egress pathway,
the fire code official of designee may issue a written citation of violation for
non-compliance, in addition to any other action permitted under this code by
the fire code official or designee. (Ord, 1507 § 3,2007, Ord. 1626
§1,2012; Ord. 1754, 11-7-2018)

76.Section++0-4112.4 amended—Violation penalties.
Section +4+60-4112.4 is amended to read as follows: Persons who shall violate
a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements
thereof or who shall erect, install alter, repair or do work in violation of the
approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a
permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor, punishable in accordance with subsection 15.24.000.C of the
Laramie municipal code. (Ord. 1466 § 107, 2005, Ord. 1626 § 1, 2012; Ord.
1754 ,11-7-2018)

8.7.Section H24113.4 amended—Failure to comply.
Section H2-4113.4 is amended to read as follows: Any person who shall
continue any work after having been served with a stop work order, except
such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or
unsafe condition, shall be subject to the penalties prescribed by the Laramie
Municipal code. (Ord. 1466 § 108, 2005, Ord. 1626 § 1, 2012; Ord. 1754 , 11-
7-2018)

8.8.Sections 507.3 and 507.5 amended—Fire flow and fire hydrant systems.

Section 507.3 and 507.5 are amended to read as follows:

a. Anapproved water supply capable of supplying required fire flow for fire
protection shall be provided to all premises upon which facilities,
buildings or portions of buildings are hereafter constructed or moved into
or within the jurisdiction. When any portion of the building protected is in
excess of 150 feet, as measured by an approved route around the exterior
of the facility or building, from a public street or approved fire
department access roadway on which a water supply meeting
requirements is provided there shall be provided, when required by the
chief, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required
fire flow.

b. Water supply may consist of reservoirs, pressure tanks, elevated tanks,
water mains or other fixed system capable of supplying their required fire
flow.

¢. The number, type, and location of fire hydrants connected to a water
supply capable of delivering the required fire flow shall be provided on
the public street, approved fire apparatus access road, or on the site of the
premises to be protected as required and approved by the fire chief or
the fire code official. All hydrantsshall beaccessibleto fire department
apparatus from city streets or fire apparatus access roadways meeting the



requirements ofthe 2015 International Fire Code Section 503 or2015IFC

Appendix D.

. Fire hydrant spacing for all zoning classifications shall conform to the
following criteria (Fire hydrant spacing distances shall be measured in a
linear manner along the street or access roadway frontage as fire apparatus
is driven along a city street or fire apparatus access roadway. Hydrant
spacing distances shall not be measured as a radius around a hydrant
location.):

() Zones RR, R1, LR, R2, AG, AV, and R2M. No point on a city street or
approved fire department vehicle access roadway serving the structure
shall be more than 400 feet from a fire hydrant. Fire hydrants shall be
placed no more than 800 feet apart.

(i) Zones R3. No point on a city street or approved fire department
vehicle access roadway serving the structure shall be more than 200
feet from a fire hydrant. Fire hydrants shall be placed no more than
400 feet apart. '

(iy Zomnes B1, LM, NB, and O. No point on a city street or approved fire
department vehicle access roadway serving the structure shall be more
than 200 feet from a fire hydrant. Fire hydrants shall be placed no more
than 400 feet apart.

(v) Zomnes B2, AE, DC and C2. No point on a city street or approved fire
department vehicle access roadway serving structure shall be more than
200 feet from a fire hydrant. Fire hydrants shall be placed nomore than
400 feet apart.

(v Zonell,12,and IP. No point on a city street or approved fire
department vehicle access roadway serving the structure shall be more
than 200 feet from a fire hydrant. Fire hydrants shall be placed no
more than 400 feet apart.

(vii Except that owners of a single-family dwelling within the corporate
limits West of Interstate 80 and meeting the requirements of
International Fire Code Section 503 and located no further than one
intersection from a city fire hydrant shall not be required to provide
additional fire hydrants.

(viy Hydrants shall be placed at city street intersections or at the
intersection of a city street and the fire apparatus road serving the
structure whenever possible. Any additional hydrants required along a
fire apparatus road shall comply with the hydrant spacing requirements
dictated by the underlying zoning district.

i) When on a divided highway, hydrants shall be placed on each side of
said highway in accordance with the spacing requirements dictated by
the underlying zoning district.

(ix) Fire hydrants shall be placed no more than 800 linear feet apart along
roadways serving undeveloped areas whenever new water lines are laid
or old water lines replaced.

(x) Before any construction involving combustible materials in any
subdivision may begin:

(1) All fire hydrants shall be operational.

(2) Streets shall be provided with all-weather driving surfaces able to
support the imposed weight fire department apparatus.

(3) Fire hydrants shall be inspected and approved by city of Laramie
public works department or Engineering Department inspectors.

4y All fire hydrants shall have been flushed and operated.

(5) Fire hydrant threads and drainage shall have been checked and
approved.

(xi) Installation and material specifications for fire lines and fire hydrants



shall be in accordance with city standards as determined by the city
engineer. Fire hydrants shall be installed and maintained so that the
breakaway flange is within two inches of the finished grade. Hydrants
shall be installed so that the 4.5 inch diameter outlet faces the city
street, fire apparatus road or fire lane adjacent to the fire hydrant.

(xi)  That the person or persons creating the need for additional fire flow
will pay for the cost of improvement. The city may enter into
agreement with the person or persons paying initial costs so that those
benefiting in the future will pay a proportionate share based upon
square footage of land area. The city may participate where oversize
lines are needed or where the city will directly benefit from
improvements in the water system.

(i) Appendix Chapters B (Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings) and C
(Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution) of the International Fire
Code and/or the Insurance Service office Commercial Grading
Schedule shall be recognized as standards of good practice which may
be enforced by the fire chief or the fire code official whenever other
provisions of the code are, at the fire chief's discretion, inadequate or
inapplicable to any situation involving the protection of persons and
property from the hazards of fire or explosions. (Ord. 1466 § 109, 2005,
Ord. 1538 § 35,2008).

16:9.Section 5304.1 amended—Storage of compressed gasses—Upright storage.
Add Paragraph to Section 5304 to read as follows: Any storage of Compressed
Natural Gas (CNGQG) is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

44.10.  Section 5504.3.1.1.3 amended—Storage—Location.
Add the following paragraph to the end of Section 5504.3.1.1.3 to read as
follows: The limits in which the storage, of flammable cryogenic fluids in
stationary containers is prohibited, are established as follows: RR, LR, R1, R2,

R3, R2M, B1,B2 and DC zones. (Ord. 1466 § 112,2005).

42:.11.__Section 5601.1 amended—Explosives and fireworks—Scope.
Add the following sentence to the end of Section 5601.1 to read as follows:
Provisions of Chapter 56 pertaining to fireworks shall extend to and be

enforceable within the city limits (Ord. 1466 § 113,2005).

43.12.  Section 5601.1.3 amended—Fireworks.

Exception 4 of Section 5601.1.3 is deleted in its entirety. (Ord. 1466 § 114,
2005).

44.13. __Section 5601.2.3 amended—Permit restrictions—Storage of explosives
and blasting agents.
Section 5601.2.3 is amended to read as follows: Storage of explosives and
blasting agents is prohibited within the corporate limits of the city. (Ord.

1466 § 115, 2005).

tanks are prohibited.

Add the following paragraphs to the end of Section 5704.2.9.6.1 to read as
follows: New bulk plants for the storage of flammable or combustible liquids
are prohibited within the area within any RR, LR, R1, R2, R3, R2M, B1, B2 and
DC zones. The limits where the storage of flammable or combustible liquids
in outside above-ground tanks is prohibited, are established as the area within any
RR, LR, R1, R2, R3, R2M, B1, B2 and DC zones. (Ord. 1466 § 116, 2005).

45.14. _ Section 5704.2.9.6.1 amended—Storage—Iocations where above-ground



46.15. __Section 5706.2.4.4 amended—Special operations—Locations where

above-ground tanks are prohibited.

Add the following paragraphs to the end of Section 5706.2.4.4 to read as
follows: New bulk plants for the storage of flammable or combustible
liquids are prohibited within the area within any RR, LR, R1, R2, R3, R2M,
B1, B2 and DC zones. The limits where the storage of flammable or
combustible liquids in outside above-ground tanks is prohibited, are
established as the area within any RR, LR, R1,R2, R3, R2M, B1, B2 and DC
zones. (Ord. 1466 § 117, 2005).

17.16.__Section 5706.4 amended—Bulk plants or terminals.

Add the following paragraph to the end of Section 5706.4 to read as follows:
New bulk plants for the storage of Class I or Class II liquids are prohibited
within the area within any RR, LR, R1, R2, R3, R2M, B1, B2 and DC zones.

(Ord. 1466 § 118, 2005).

48:17._ Section 6104.2 amended—Location of containers—Maximum capacity
within established limits.
Add the following paragraph to the end of Section 6104.2 to read as
follows: The geographic limits, as to the storage of liquefied petroleum
gas is restricted for the protection of heavily populated or congested
areas, are established as follows: RR, LR, R1, R2, R3, R2M, B1, B2
and DC zones. (Ord. 1466 § 119, 2005).

49:18.

Enforcement.

20:19.

a. Anyperson who violates any ofthe provisions of the International Fire

a. The International Fire Code shall be enforced by the life safety and fire

prevention division of the fire

department of the city which is established and which shall be
operated under the supervision of the fire chief in cooperation with
the City Manager's Office and its building official.

. The fire chief may detail such members of the fire department and

members of the code administration division asinspectors as shall
fromtimeto time as may be necessary.

. The fire chief and other individuals charged by the fire chief with the

control or extinguishment of any fire, the enforcement of this code or
any other official duties, acting in good faith and without malice in the
discharge of their duties, shall not thereby be rendered personally
liable for any damage that may accrue to persons or property as a
result of any act or by reason of any act or omission in the discharge of
their duties.

. The code shall not be construed to relieve from or lessen the responsibility

of any person owning, operating or controlling any building or structure
for any damages to person or property caused by defects, nor shall the
code enforcement agency or its parent jurisdiction be held as assuming any
such liability by reason of the inspections authorized by this code or any
permits or certificates issued under this code. (Ord. 1466 § 121, 2005, Ord.
1538 §38,2008).

IFC fines, penalties and fees.

Codeas adopted and amended, or fails to comply with, or who violates or
fails to comply with any order made, or who builds in violation of any
detailed statement or specifications or plans submitted and approved, or
any certificate or permit issued, from which no appeal has been taken,
shall severally for each and every such violation and noncompliance,



respectively, be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not less
than fifty dollars nor more than seven hundred fifty dollars in accordance
with Chapter 1.28 of this code. This section is in addition to all other
remedies which the city may use to enforce compliance.

b. The fire chief, subject to the approval of the city manager, shall establish a fee

schedule as follows: repeated false alarms fifty dollars upon the third alarm;
repeated reinspection’s fifty dollars upon the third visit; and repeated
acceptance testing fifty dollars on the third visit.

c. The firechief, subject to the approval of the city manager, shall establish
recovery costs for extraordinary costs of fire-cause determination; costs
ofhazardous materialsincident containment; and extraordinary costs of
fire emergency operations. (Ord. 1466 § 122, 2005).

24.20.  New Materials, Processes New Materials, Processes, or Occupancies

Requiring Permits. The city manager, the city

fire chief and the city fire marshal shall act as a committee to determine
and specify, after giving affected persons an opportunity to be heard, any
new materials, procedures or occupancies, which require permits in
addition to those enumerated in the International Fire Code. The fire
chief shall post such list in a conspicuous place in his office and
distribute copies thereof to interested persons. (Ord. 1466 § 123, 2005,
Ord. 1538 § 39, 2008).

22.21.  Permit Waivers.

a. Thefire chiefmay waive enforcement and permit requirements to engage
in certain activities, operations, practices or functions; provided that he
finds the public safety is not impaired and substantial justice done by
waivingtherequirement.

b. The fire chief may waive the enforcement and permit requirements in
Chapter 50 of the International Fire Code. (Ord. 1466 § 124,2005).

23.22.  Appeals. In cases where the fire chief disapproves an application, refuses

to grant a permit, or determines that the provisions of the International Fire
Code do not apply or that the true intent and meaning of the International Fire
Code has been misconstrued or wrongly interpreted, such action on behalf of
the fire chief may be appealed to the Building and Fire Code Board of
Appeals within fifteen days of the day upon which the action has been taken.
(Ord. 1466 § 125,2005; Ord. 1626,8§ 1,2012).

(Ord. No. 1466 §§ 102, 104, 111, 113, 2005; Ord. No. 1507 § 2, 2007, Ord. No. 1538 §§ 32, 33,
2008; Ord. No. 1507 § 2, 2007; Ord. No. 1578, § 2(att. A), 3-2-2010; Ord. No. 1626, § 1, 9-4-
2012; Ord. No. 1707 , 6-7-2016; Ord. 1754 , 11-7-2018; Ord. No. 1757 , §§ 4—6, 12-

4-2018)

Section 2:

This ordinance shall become effective after passage, approval and publication.



PASSED AND APPROVED THIS 21% day of December 2021.

2 “r W/\

o [Paul Weaver, Mayor and Preside\h\
@ T of the City Council of the City of Laramie,
- Wyoming

ATTEST:" .

Y =
E;néy B hof‘cm‘rew, CMC

ity Clerk

First Reading: November 16, 2021
Second Reading: December 7, 2021
Public Hearing: December 7, 2021
Third Reading: December 21, 2021

Duly published in the Laramie Daily Boomerang this 29" day of December, 2021.




